of 1948,

ACT 1956
ACt No. 101 oF 1956

“An Act further to amend the Electr1c1ty (Supply) Act, 1948
' [30th December, 1956] -

BE it enacted ’by Parhament in the Seventh Year of the Republlc
of India as follows

1. (I) This Act may be called the Electriexty (Supply) Amend- Short title,
ment Act, 1956.

(@) The provisions of this Act except the provisions. of sub-clause -
(i) of clause (b) of section 27 and clauses, (¢) to (1) of that section -
shall come into force at once; the provisions of sub-clause (ii) of
clause (b) of section 27 and clauses (¢) to () of that section shall
come into force on such date' as the Central Government may, by
notlﬁcatlon in the Official Gazette, appoint.

2. In section 1 of the Electr1c1ty (Supply) Act, 1948 (heremafter Amendment
referred to as the principal Act), for sub-section (3), the following °f section 1.
sub-sectlon shall be substxtuted namely:—

“(3) This section and sections 2, 3, 4, 57, 57A, 57B, 58, 76
71, 174, 71B, 77C, 82 and 83 and the provisions of the Sixth and _
the Seventh Schedules shall come into force at once.

3. In section 2 of the prineipal Act, for clause- (8), the following Afmexég:ox:]enzt
clause shall be substituted, namely: — o oo o

“(8) ‘maximum demand’ in relation to any period shall,
unless otherwise provided in any general or special order of the
State Government, mean twice the largest number of kilowatt-
hours or kilo-volt-ampere-hours supplied and taken during any

- consecutive thirty minutes in that period;”. ;

4. In section 5 of the principal Act, for sub-section (4) the follow- Amendment
ing sub-section shall be substituted, namely:— of Sec“‘ms
#(4) Of the members— '

(a) one shall be a person who has experience ‘of, and

has shown capacity 1n, commercial matters and administra- .
twn,

(b) one shall be an electr1ca1 engmeer W1th Wlde
experience; and : : '

1lst Apr11 1957 for provisions of sub -clause (i1) - of -clause (b) and.‘. ;
clauses (¢) to (€3] of s, 27, vide Notification No. SRO 661, - dated 21st
February, 1957, see Gazette of Indla, 1957, Pt. II, Sec. 3, p. 38 7




- tain n-
sactions void,: - -

o e e !

Amendment

-of section 10,

Insertion -of

new sectlon
10A.,

Power of
State  Gov-

ernment  to.
declare  cer-
tran-

S~

;‘f“

-ing and ﬁnanc1a1 m-atters 1n a pubhc “utility undertakmg,
‘preferably an electrlc1ty supply undertakmg ”

-5, Sect1on 10 of the pr1nc1pal Act shall be re-numbered as sub-
sectwn (1) thereof, ‘and—

{a) in sub-section (1) as so re-numbered for clause (e), the
followmg clause shall be substituted, namely:—

“(e) in the opinion of the State Government—— :

(i) has refused -to act; or -
(i) has become incapable of acting; or

(ii) has so abused his position as a member as to
- render his continuance on the Board detr1mental to the
interests of the general public; or

{iv) is otherwise unfit to continue as a member or”;

(b) after sub-section (I) as so re—numbered the followmg ’
sub-sections shall be inserted, namely —

“(2) The State Government may suspend any member -
‘pendjng ‘an inquiry against him, ' :

(3) No order of removal shall be made under this section
‘unless the member concerned has been given -an-opportunity
to submit his explanation to the ~State Government, and
when such order is passed, the seat of the member removed

“shall become vacant and another member may appomted
‘under section 5 to fill up the vacancy.

(4) A member who has been removed shall not be
. eligible for re—appomtment as member or in any other capa-
" city to the Board. ‘

(5) If the Board fails to carry out. its functions, or
refuses or fails to follow the directions issued by the State
. Government under. this Act, the State Government ‘may
remove the Chairman and the members of the Board and
appoint a Chairman and members in their places”.

6. After section 10 of the pr1nc1pa1 Act, the following sectlon shall .
be dnserted, namely:—

“10A. (1) The State Government may declare void any tran-
saction in connection with which a member has been removed
under sub-clause (iii) of clause (e) of sub-section (1) of section
10 after. cons1der1ng the report on the facts of the case made
to it' by -a District Judge nommated by it in: thls behalf,




Bep.by Aot €5 o108

oF 1956] . Electricity (Supply) Amendment - 1145 -

' g of 1872,

y

- before making his report under that sub-section to the State
Government in relation to any transaction, give all parties

_ interested in the transaction a 1easondb1e opportunity of being-
heard.

(3) Where a transaction is declared void under this section,
it shall not be enforceable by any party to the transaction but
the provisions of section 85 of the Indian Confract Act, 1872,
shall, so far as may be, apply to such transaction as they
apply to an agreement which is discovered to be void.or a con-

" tract which becomes void. ‘

(4) The decision of the Stéte Government declaring any
transaction void under this section shall be ﬁnal and shall not
be called in question in any court.”.

7. To sectlon 15 of the principal Act, the followmg proviso shall Amendment
be added, namely: — of section 15,

“Provided that the appointment of -the Secretary shall be
subject to the approval of the State Government.”.

8. In section 16 of the principal Act,— Amendment

(¢) for the words ‘State Electricity Council’ wherever they of section If’

occur, the words ‘State Electricity Consultative Council’ shall
be substituted;

. (b) in sub-section (2), for the words ‘and labour employed

in the electricity supply industry’, the words ‘labeur employed

_in the electricity supply industry and consumers of electricity’
shall be substituted.

9. In section 23 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2), the words Amendment
'on terms similar to the terms offered by the Board’ shall be omitted, °f section 23.

10 In section 26 of the principal Act,— Amendment

(a) in the proviso, for the words and ﬁgures ‘Clauses I to of secuon 26.
XIT’, the words and figures ‘Clauses I to V, Clause VII and
Clauses IX to XII' shall: be substituted;

(b) after the existing proviso, the following proviso shall
be inserted, namely:—-

“Provided further that the provisions of Clause VI of the .
- Schedule to that Act shall apply to the - Board in respect
of that area only where distribution mains have been laid by -

the Board and the supply of energy through any of them has ~
commenced.”,

1512 M. of Law-—144 - T T e

@) A District Judge no iinated Gnder sub-sectlon Y shal, T o




‘ dﬁep by Act g(fofl

1146 Elect’rtcwy (Supply) Amendment - - [act 101

T ?\mendmrnf

- of section 28 4 " word Provided’, the word ‘further’ shall beinserted and before
the said proviso, the followmg proviso shall be inserted, namely:—

“Provided thait no scheme or a part of a scheme which is
estimated to result in a capital expenditure exceeding fifteen
lakhs of rupees shall be prepared by the Board W1thout pr1or

- consultation ‘with-the State Government”

Amen@ment ~ 12, In section 29 of the principal Act,—
) of section 29.

(a) in sub-section (1), for the words and ﬁgures “The Board

shall cause every scheme prepared under section 28, the words - -
and figures ‘Unless otherwise directed by the State Government

- or the Authority, the Board shall send a copy of every scheme
prepared under section 28 to the State Government and to the

Authority and shall cause every such scheme’ shall be substi-
tuted;

(b) in the first proviso to sub-section (2), for the words

‘fifty lakhs of rupees’, the words ‘one crore of rupees’ shall be
~ substituted

Amendment 13. Section 55 of the pr1nc1pa1 Act shall be re-numbered as sub-
of sectxon 55..section (1) thereof, and—

5 f . (g in sub-sectmn (1) as so re-numbered,—

(i) for the word ‘directions’, the words
directions’ shall be substltuted

(i1) for the words ‘the station’, the words ‘his under-
tak1ng or any part thereof’ shall be substituted;

_(b) after sub-section (1) as so re-numbered, the followmg
sub-sect1on shall be inserted, namely:—

‘reasonable

“(2) It any dispute arises between the Board and the

‘licensee as to whether any directions given under sub-section

(1) are reasonable or not, it shall be referred to the
Authorlty whose decision thereon shall be final.”.

Substitution- 14. For section 57 of the principal Act, the followmg sections
of new shall be substituted, namely —

. sections for .
section 57 , o ‘ '
Licensee’s “57, The provisions of the_ Sixth Schedule and the Seventh
chgg%e; ertso Schedule shall- be deemed to be incorporated in the licence of
o ) . .

every licensee, not being a local authority—

(a) in the case of a licence granted before the com-
mencement of this Act, from the date of the commencement
ot the licensee’s next succeeding year of account; and

"3“11 Ti section 28761 the” p*fi‘n’oipﬁl Aét; i the cxisting Proviso, Ffgap T



Eleciricity (Supply) Amendment Trdy

of a heence granted after the c‘ommence-

~ ¢ of 1910.

supply,
and as from the said date, the llcensee shall comply with the
provisions of the said Schedules accordmgly, ‘and any-provisions

"of the Indian Electricity Act, 1910,-and thelicence granted to

him thereunder and of any other law, agreement or instrument
applicable to the licensee shall, in relation to the licensee, be

cement ) R T

void and of no effect in so far as they are inconsistent with the '

provisions of section 57A and the said Schedules

57A. (1) Where the provisions of the Sixth. Schedule and
the Seventh Schedule are under section 57 deemed to be incor-
porajed in the licence of any licensee, the following provisions
shall have effect in relation to the said licensee, namely:—

(a) the Board or where no Board is constituted under
this Act,-the State Government—

Ratmg
‘committees.

(1) may, if satisfied that the licensee has fa11ed to

comply with any of the provisions of the Sixth Schedule;
and , ,

(i) shall when so requested by the licensee in
~writing,

constltute a rating committee to examine the licensee’s

charges for the supply of electricity and to make recom-

mendations in that behalf to the State Government:

Provided that where it is proposed to constitute a rating

committee under this section on account of the failure of
the licensee to comply with any provisions of the Sixth
Schedule, such committee shall not be constituted unless

the licensee has been given a notice in writing of thirty.

clear days (which period, if the circumstances so warrant
- may be extended from time to time) to show cause against
the action proposed to be taken:

Provided further that no such rating committee shall be
constituted if the .alleged failure of the licensee to comply
with any provisions of the Sixth Schedule raises any dispute
or difference as to the interpretation of the said provisions
or any matter arising therefrom and such difference or dis-

- pute has been referred by the licensee to the arbitration of
the Authority under paragraph XVI of that Schedule before
the notice referred to in the preceding proviso was given or
is so referred within the period of the said notice:




 Rep.byAct G of 1960 S

148 Electricity (S‘upply) Amendment - {acr 101

Provided further that no rating committee shall be

the date on which such a committee has reported in respect

of that licensee, unless the State Government declares that T

in its opinion circumstances have arisen rendering the orders
passed onh the recommendations of the previous rating
committee unfair fo the licensee or any of his consumers;

(b) a rating committee under clause (a) shall,—

. (i) where such committee is to be constituted under
sub-clause (i) of that clause, be constituted not later
than three months after the expiry of the notice referred
to in the first proviso to that clause;

(i) where such committee is to be constituted at
the request of the licensee, be constituted within three
months of the date of such request;

“ (c) 'a rating committee shall, after giving the licensee
a reasonable opportunity of being heard and after taking
into consideration the efficiency of operation and manage-
ment and the potentialities of his undertaking, report to the
State Government within three months from the date of its
constitution, making recommendations with reasons therefor,
regarding the charges for electricity which the licensee may
make to any class or classes of consumers so, however, that
the recommendations are not likely to prevent the 11cense/e
from earning clear profit sufficient when taken with the
sums available in the Tariffs and Dividends Control Reserve
to afford him a reasonable return as defined in the Sixth
Schedule during his next succeeding three years of account:

Provided that the State_ Government rrray, if it se deems

- necessary, extend the said period of three months by a

further period not exceeding three months within which the

. Teport of the rating committee may be submitted to it;

(d) within one month after the receipt of the report
under clause (c), the State Government shall cause the
report to be published in the Official Gazette, and may at
the same time make an order in accordance therewith fixing
the licensee’s charges for the supply of electricity with effect
from such date, not earlier than two months or later than
three months, after the date of publication of the report

as may be specified in the order and the licensee shall forth-

with give effect to such order;

constituted-in-respeet-of -a-licensee: ‘within three years trom R



“Hep. by Acd Wm“ | R

or '1,95;..6] Electricity . (S“?ipplq) Amendment 1149

e (@) the- charges-for-the- supply of e1ectr1c1ty ‘fixed under
clause (d) .shall be in operation for such period not exceed-

ing three years as the State Government may specify in the

order:

Provided that nothing in this clause shall be deemed to

prevent a licensee from reducing at any time any charges
so fixed.

(2) Where a Board is constituted under this Act, the rating
eommittee shall consist of three members as follows:—

(i) one member shall be nominated by the State Gov-
ernment who shall be a person who is or has been a judicial
officer not below the rank of a District Judge;

(#) one member shall be a member of the Board having
-experience of accounting and financial matters; and

(iii) one member shall be a representative co-opted
jointly by the two members referred to in clauses (i) and
(i) from an association of licensees of which the licensee
concerned is or is eligible to be a member, and if there is no
such association, from such Chamber of Commerce or
similar body as the State Government may direct.

(3) Where no Board is constituted under this Act, the rating
committee shall consist of five members of whom three
members shall be nominated by the State Government, one
member shall be nominated by the licensee and one member
shall be nominated by the association referred to in sub-section
(2) or if there is no such association, by such Chamber of Com-
merce or similar body as the State Government may direct.

4 Of the three members to be nominated by the State.
Government under sub-section (3), one shall be a person who.
is or has been a judicial officer not below the rank of a District

~ Judge, one shall be a registered accountant within the meaning

38 of 1949. - of the Chartered Accountants Act, 1949, having at least ten
years’ experience and one shall be a person with administrative
experience,

) (5) The ;]ud1c1al member of a ratmg committee shall be its
‘ chairman,

(6) A rating. committee may act notwithstanding that one
of its members is absent. '



Rop. by Aer  CF 011980

o 11'50 . ' E’iectmczty (Su.ppiy) Amendment , i:Ac'r 101

- Gommittee as certified by it shall be payable,—

(a) wheré the rating committee was constituted at the
request of a licensee, or where the rating committee has
held that the licensee has failed to comply with any of the

part of the clear profit to which the licensee. is entitled
under that Schedule;

ernment, as the case may be.

(8) Where a licensee makes-default in paying any amount
which he is liable to pay under sub-section (7), such amount
may, on application to a civil court having jurisdiction, be

* recovered from the licensee by the distress and sale of 'any
movable property of the licensee.
Power  of 57B. A rating committee constltuted under section 57A may,
e o for the purpose of discharging its functions, by hotice in writing,
call - for in- require the licensee to give such information, or to furnish such
formation, accounts and other documents in his possession or power, as may
be specified in the notice.” :

* Amendment 15 To section 58 of the prmmpal Act, the followmg prov1so shall
- of section 58. e gdded, namely:—

“Provided that the Board shall not- issue any directions
under this section except after obtaining the prior approval of
the State Government.”,

Amendm - 16. In section 60 of the pr1nc1pal Act, after sub-section (1) the
. following sub-section shall be inserted, namely: — .

‘ “(1A) All schemes sanctioned by the State Government and
transferred to the Board shall, for the purposes of this Act be
"deemed to have been sanctioned by the Board.”.

Amendment 17 In section 67 of the pr1nc1pal Act,— ,
" of section 67.
. (a) after the words management expenses’, the words ‘and

- ‘after provision has been made for the payment of taxes on its
income and profits’ shall be inserted;

(b) in clause (vi), the words ‘repayment of principal and’
shall be omitted;

(c) after clause (zm), the folilowmg .clause shall be inserted,
namely —

ble assets to the extent to which they are actually appropriat-

(7) “The- expendlture 1ncurred giio éﬁnnectx_on Wlth ey ~f¢rat1ngu-,;,‘,

provisions ‘of the Sixth Schedule, by the licensee from that

(b) in any other case, by the Board or the State Gov-

“(viia) the write-down of amounts in respect of intangi- -

ed in any year for the purpose in the books of the Board;”;




ﬁwo@ ?‘é&@@ SY\@Q?L@OQ

o OF 1956] _ Elect1 zczty (Supply) Amendment ‘ C 1151

(d) in clause (vm), after the Words not exceedlng, the
words ‘one-half of’ shall be inserted;

(e) for clause (x), the following clause shall be substltuted
namely:—

“(x) of the balance remaining, one-half in the reduction
of tariffs or for such other purposes beneficial to electrical
development in the State, as the Board may think fit, and the
remaining one-half to the Consolidated Fund of the State.”.

18. ¥or sections 68 and 69 of the principal Act, the followmg Sfubstlfutlon
sectiong shall be substituted, namely:— gon;l v ?ii'
sections 68

and 69.

“68. (1) The Board shall create a depreciation reserve and, Pe.:gfsgat‘o“

- . . as far as compliance with the provisions of section 67 makes it
: . practicable, shall, at the end of every year, credit to such reserve
from its revenue, such amount as would if made annually
throughout the prescribed period of assets specified in the Table
appended to the Seventh Schedule and accumulated at compound

- interest at the rate of three per centum per annum produce by
the end of the prescribed period an amount equal fo 90 per
centum of the original cost of the assets after taking into ac-
count the sums already written off and set aside in the books
of the Board. '

(2) The amount to be credited every year to the depfécia’ti‘on
reserve under sub-section (I) Shall consist of the incremental
deposit plus interest on the accumulated balance in the reserve:

" Provided that the contribution in respect of any asset to the
depreciation reserve under this section shall cease at the end of
the prescribed period as defined in the Sixth Schedule or when
the asset ceases to be used by the Board, whichever is earlier:

Provided further that if in any year it is not practicable fully
to comply with the provisions of this section, the amount by
which the sums actually credited falls short of the amount re-
quired under this section in respect of that year, shall be carried
forward and together with compound interest thereon at the
aforesaid rate, shall be credited to the said reserve as soon as it
is found possible'in accordance with section 67, so to do:

Provided further that the accumulations in the depre01at10n
reserve may be invested in the business of the Board, or utilised
~ for repayment of principal not guaranteed under section 66 or for
repayment. of sums paid by the State Government under guaran-
- -tees under that section.



‘hep by Act Y ot 1980

69. (1) The Board shall cause proper accounts and other
- records in relation thereto to be kept, in¢luding a proper system
of internal check and-prepare an annual statement of accounts,
“including the profit and loss account and the balance sheet in
such form as may be prescribed by the State Government in
consultation with the Comptroller and Auditor-General of India.

(2) The accounts of the Board shall be audited by the

Comptroller and Auditor-General of India or by such person

~ as he may authorise in this behalf and any expenditure incur-

red by him in connection with such audit shall be payable by
the Board to the Comptroller and Auditor-General of India.

(3) The Comptroller and Auditor-General of India and any
person authorised by him in connection with the audit of the
accounts of the Board shall have the same rights, privileges and
authority in connection with such audit as the Comptroller and
Auditor-General of India has in connection with the audit of
Government accounts and in particular shall have the right to
demand the production of books, accounts, connected vouchers

- and othér documents and papers, and to 1nspect any of the oﬁices
- of the Board. :

4 The acCounts of 'the Board as certified by the Comptrol-
ler and Auditor-General of India or any other person authorised
by him in this behalf together with the audit report thereon shall
be forwarded annually to the State Government and that Gov-
ernment may issue such instructions to the Boafd in respect
thereof as it deems fit and the Board shasll comply with such
mstructlons .

' (5) The State Government shall—

(a) cause the accounts of the Board together with the
" audit report thereon forwarded to it under sub-section (4)
to be laid annually before the State Legislature; and

(b) cause the accounts of the Board to be published
in the prescribed manner and make available copies thereof
on sale -at a reasonable price.”

Amendment
af section 75. following sub-section shall be inserted, namely:—

“(IA) Without prejudice to the provisions of sub-section
(1), the Board shall, as soon ag may be after the end of each
financial year, prepare and submit to the State Government in
such form as may be prescribed a report giving an account of its
activities during the previous financial year and the report shall

Electmczty (Supply) Amendment [ACT 101

19. In section 75 of the principal Act, after sub-section (I}, the




i

100f 1940

1512 M.

gg@ by At J‘%! w62 . |
OF 19581 Electricity (Supply) Amendment a 1153

“Hlse” give an account of the activities, it any, Whick are hkely o e T

be undertaken by the Board in the next fihancial year; and the
State Government shall cause every such report to be laid before

~ the State Legislature as soon as may be after it is received by
the State Government.”. '

20. In section 76 of the principal Act, after sub-section (3), the Amendmeny
R . X : of section 76,
following sub-sections shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3A) Where ariy guestion or matter is referred to the
Authority for arbitration under this section,—

(a) the Authority shall be deemed to ‘enter on the refer-
ence for the purposes of paragraph 3 of the First Schedule
to the Arbitration Act, 1940, on the date on which the partles
appear before the Authority for the first time:

: ‘Provided that where the parties or any of them fail to
appear hefore the Authority on the date fixed for the first
hearing of the case and the Authority decides either on that
date or any subsequent date to proceed with the case in the
absence of the parties or any of them, as the case may be,
the Authority shall be deemed to enter on the reference on -
the date of such decision;

‘ (b) the Authority may, having regard to the circum-
stances of each case, charge such arbitration fee as it -may
deem reasonable,

(3B) All fees and charges due to the Authority in respect
of any arbitration and award and all costs and charges for filing
the award incurred by the Authority may, if they are not paid
by -the person from whom they are due within a peried of one
month from the date of a notice given to him by the Authority
in this behalf, be recovered from him in the same manner as an
arrear of land revenue.”. ' '

21. For section 77 of the principal Act the following sections shall Substitution

be subst1tuted namely:— ?ﬁ) JDew a0
section  77.

“77. If any 1icensee or other person, not being the Board, Penalties,

fails without reasonable excuse to comply with, or give effect
to, any direction, order or requirement made under any of the
following provisions, namely:—

(a) section 4; or

_ (b) section 55;or
(c) clause (d) of sub-section (1) of section 57A; or
(d) section 57B; or

PR e afreee m s,

of Law—145



Rep. by Act S5 of 1060 | o
154 : Electmczty (Supply) Amendment {A’d*r 10

—{e).- se(.tlon 58 01

" he shall be pumshable with fine which may extend to five -
hundred rupees, and -in’ the case of a continuing offence with a
further fine which may extend to fifty rupees for each day after
the first during which the offence continues.

Source from. 77A. All ﬁnesApayablye by a licensee under this Act or under

which fines®.  any other law for the time being in force in respect of any
may be paid.

offence committed by the licensee, shall be payable by him from

that part of the clear profit to which he is entitled under the
Sixth Schedule.

Offences by 7B, (1) If the person commlttmg an offence under this Act

companies. - jg 3 company, every person who at the timé the offence was
- committed was in charge of, and was responsible to, the com- -

. pany for the conduct of the business of the company as well as

the company, shall be deemed to be guilty of the offence and

shall be liable to be proceeded against and punished accordingly:

Provided that nothing contained -in this sub-section shall
render any such person liable to any punishment, if he proves
that the offence was committed without his knowledge or that

. he exercised all due diligence to prevent the commission of
" such offence. '

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in sub-section (1), :
where an offence under this Act has been committed with the. o
~ consent or connivance of, or is attributable to any neglect on the
~ part of, any director or manager, secretary or other officer of-
the company, such director, manager, secretary or other officer
shall also be deemed to be guilty of that offence and shall be
liable to be proceeded against and punished accordingly.

Explanation.—For the purposes of this section,—

(a) (.ompany means .any body corporate and mcludes
a firm or other ass001at10n of individuals; and

b) ‘dlrector in relation to a firm means a partner in
the firm,

) 77C. No court shall take cognizance of an offence under
%ﬁgggggs section 77, except on the complaint of,—

(a) in the case of an offence relatmg to section 4, by an

officer of the Authority authorised in that behalf by the
Authority;

S

- Af) sub-sectlon (3) of section 75 ‘



dpgr——en e
g

Rep. by et 15 of 186 T a T Ty

or 19561 ; Electmcv;ty (Supply) Amcndmem - 1155 . T

“(b) in the case of any ‘other oﬂ’ence-—

(i) where a Board is constituted, by an officer of
the Board authorised by the Board in that behalf;

~ (i1) where no Board is constituted, by an officer
of the State Government authorised by the State Gov-
ernment in that behalf.”.

22. In section 78 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2),— (‘:‘fn;:gg;ﬂ;'g.

(3) in clause (a), for the words ‘the term of office’, the words

. ‘the powers of the Cha1rman and the term of office shall be
substituted; -

(ii) in clause (b), for the words ‘State Electricity Councilg’,

" the words ‘State Electricity Consultatlve Councils’ shall be sub-

stituted.
23. After section 78 of the principal Act, the following section Inseruon‘ of
shall be inserted, namely:— _ ngX “section
7

“78A. (1) In the discharge of its functions, the Board shall Directions
be guided by such directions on questions of policy as may be tg'otv}g msnt::;
given to it by the State Government.

(2) If any dispute arises between the Board and the State
Government as to whether a question is or is not a question
of policy, it shall be referred to the Authorlty whose decision
thereon shall be final.”,

24. In sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph I.of the First Schedule to Amendment
the principal Act, for the words beginning with ‘shall accept’ and gfh 4 lFlm
ending with ‘on terms similar to the terms offered by the Board’, chedule
the followmg shall be substituted, namely:—

“may accept the loan from the Board on the terms and
‘conditions offered or may raise a loan from other sources or
_ “employ his own funds for the. purpose of such extension,”

_ 25 In sub-clause (i) of clause (b) of paragraph V of the Th1rd Amendment
Schedule to the principal Act, after the words ‘the station’, -the St;hcdugh“d
‘words ‘or the entire undertaking’ shall be inserted.

26. In the Fifth Schedule to the principal Act,— Afmendtlrgl.efxtlﬁ
‘ o 1
~ (a) in paragraph I—  Schedule.

(i) in-clause (b), for the words and brackets °(includ-
ing super-tax payable by the licensee - as a company, but
excluding other taxes on profits)’, the words and brackets
‘(including all taxes payable on 1ncome and profits)’ shall
be substituted; ~




% by Act fs/of'lbﬁ °

F156

>

Electriczty (Supply) Amendment | [acr 101

(u) 1n clause (e), for the words and brackets begmnmg -

with ‘interest on money’ and ending with ‘attributable to

lines’, the following words and brackets shall be substituted,
namely —

“interest on the deprecidted cost of the lines shown
in the books of the undertaking and properly - attribu-
table to the lines (whether defrayed out of capital or
revenue) and interest on such working capital as is pro-
perly attributable to the lines.”; .

(b) in paragraph III, in sub-clause (b), for the words and
figure ‘56 per centum per annum’, the following words shall be
substituted, namely:—

“the Reserve Bank Rate ruling at the beginning of ’ﬁhe

year referred to in paragraph I plus two per centum”,

27. In the Sixth Schedule to the principal Act,—

(a) for the<words, brackets and figures ‘(See section 57) ’
the words, brackets, figures and letter ‘(See sections - 57 and
5TA)’ shall be substituted; '

(b) in paragraph I,

(1) for the words ‘The licensee shall so adjust his rates

for the sale of electricity by periodical revision that his clear
profit in any year shall not as far as possible exceed the

. amount of reasonable return’, the following shall be- sub-
stituted, namely:— , —

“Notw1thstand1ng anythlng contained in the Indian
Electricity Act, 1910, and the provisions in the licence of
a licensee, the licensee shall so adjust his rates for the

them that his clear profit in any year of account shall

not, as far as possible, exceed the amount of reasonable
return:’

(i) for the proviso, the following provisos shall 'be'
substituted, namely:—

9 of 1910

.sale of electricity whether by enhancing or reducing

“Provided that such rates shall not be enhehced '

more than once in any year of account:

Provided further that the licensee shall not be deem-
ed to have failed so to adjust his rates if the clear profit
in any year of account has not exceeded the amount of
reasonable return by fifteen per centum of the amount
of reasonable return:



© 11 of 1922

i)

B . T

¥

WVM | erdment
Electmcwty (Supply) Amendment _ | 1Is7

Wr %0

Prov1ded further ‘that the llcensee shall “mot e

enhance the rates for the supply of electricity until
after the expiry of a notice in writing of not less than
sixty clear days of his intention to so enhance the rates,
given by him to the State Government and to the
Board: ' '

Provided further that if the rates of supply fixed in
pursuance of the recommendations of a rating committee
constituted under section 57A are lower than those
‘notified by the licensee under and in accordance with
the preceding’ proviso, the licensee shall refund to the
consumers the excess amount recovered by him from

 them.”;

(¢) in sub-paragraph (1) of paragraph II, for the words and
figures ‘7% per cent’, the words ‘five per cent.” shall be substh
tuted;

~ (d) paragraph V shall be re-numbered as sub-paragrapn,
(1) thereof and after sub-paragraph (I) as so re-numbered, the
following ‘sub-paragraph shall be inserted, namely:—

“(2) On the purchase of the undertaking, the balance .
remaining in the Contingencies Reserve shall be handed
over to the purchaser and maintained as such Contmgen—

. cies Reserve.” ‘

(e) after paragraph V, the followmg paragraph shall be
inserted, namely:—

“VA. (1) There shall be created a reserve to be called
‘the Development Reserve to. which shall be appropriated -in
respect of each accounting year a sum equal-to the amount
of .income-tax and super-tax calculated at rates applicable
during the assessment year for which the accounting year
of the licensee is the previous year, on the amount of deve-
lopment rebate to which the licensee is entitled for the
accounting year under clause (vib) of sub-section (2) of
section 10 of the Indian Income-tax Act, 1922:

Provided that if in any-accounting year, the clear profit
[excluding the special appropriation to be made under item
(va) of clause (c), of sub-paragraph (2) off paragraph XVII]
together with the accumulations, if any, in the Tariffs and -
Dividends Control Reserve less the sum calculated as
aforesaid falls short of the reasonable return, the sum to be
appropriated to the Development Reserve in respect of such

- accounting year shall be reduced by the armount of the
. .short- fall .




~ fRep. by Act S B

58

Electncwy (Supply) Amendment N _ - [AC’I‘ 101

ment Reserve in respect of anf accounting year under sub-

paragraph (1), may be appropriated in -annual instalments '
- spread over a peried not exceeding five years from ' the

commencement of that accounting year.

3) The Development Reserve shall be available only

for investment in the business of electricity. supply of the -

undertaking.

(4) On the purchase of the undertaklng, the Develop-

ment Reserve shall be handed over to the purchaser and :

maintained as such Development Reserve.”
(f) in paragraph VI—

(i) in sub-paragraph (2), after  the words ‘electricity
supply of the undertaking or’, the words ‘where it is not
practicable to so invest them’ shall be inserted;

(ii). after sub-paragraph (2), the following sub-para-

.graph shall be inserted, namely:—

“(3) Any sums invested. in investments approved by
the State Government under sub-paragraph (2) shall, as

soon as practicable, be utilised in the business of electri-

city supply of the undertaking and if such sums are not

so utilised they shall not form part of the capital base

under clause (d) of sub-paragraph (1)’ of paragraph
S XVIL

(9) in paragraph VII for sub-paragraphs (2) and 3, the

-following sub-paragraphs shall bé substituted, namely:—

“(2) The written down cost of such fixed asset shall be
charged against the Contingencies Reserve:

Provided that where the accumulations in the Contingen-
cies Reserve are not sufficient to permit the charging of the

_entire written down cost of the asset, the excess amount
may, be included in the capital base for the purpose of clause

(ay of sub -paragraph (1) of paragraph XVII.

(3) The amount for which any such fixed asset is sold or
the amount of its scrap value when actually reahsed shall he
credited to the Contingencies Reserve.”

(h) in paragraph IX, after the words ‘the excess’, the words

‘after deducting all taxes payable thereon’ shall be 1nser_ted

(i) for paragraph X, the following paragraph shall be sub-

stituted, namely:——

“X’ Except with the previous consent of the State
Government, no sums shall be carried forward to a reserve

(2) Any sum to be approprlated towards the Develop- B



Rep. by Aot . (E oy ot ig§> W 3’? Y
oF 15561 Electricity. (Supplty) Amendmeni - 1159

. and no -dividends in excess of 3 'per cent. shall be paid on
' flhare capital and no other distribution of profits: shall be
made to the shareholders in respect of any year of account
80 long-as any of the following sums remain to be written
off in the books of the undertaking, namely: —

feo Lo (i) normal depreciation due for that year of account
: calculated in accordance with the provisions of para-
graph VI;

(i1) equated instalmént in respect of arrears of
depreciation, computed in accordance with- the provi-
‘sions of paragraph XI, for that year of .aceount;

(iii) arrears, if any, in respect of normal deprecia-
tion referred to in clause (i), accumulated after the
date of application of the provisions of the Sixth
Schedule to the licensee;

Bl (iv) arrears, if any; in respect - of equated instal-
«.-”  ments referred to in clause (ii).”;

[

)] in paragraph XIII,—

(a) in sub-paragraph (I), for the words, figures, -
brackets and letter ‘as defined in section 87C(3) of the
Indian Companies Act, 1913, (7 of 1913), the followmg
shall be substituted, namely: —

“as determined in accordance with the provisions of.

1 of 1936, section 349 of the Companies Act, 1956.; _ :
gm (b) the: followmg Explanatzon shall be added at the .
B end, namely:— -

“Explanation.—For the purposes of this paragraph -
the expression = ‘managing agent’ shall include every
person, by whatever name called, who is in charge of
‘the management of the whole, or substantially the
whole, of the undertaking and where more persons than
one are placed in' charge of the management of the
" whole, or substantially the whole, of the undertaking,
the total remuneration payable to all such persons shall
! mnot in the aggregate exceed the limits specified in this
paragraph.”;

(k) to paragraph XVI, the following proviso shall be added,
namely :—

) “Provided that where a rating committee has bee_n
. _ constituted under section 57A, no such dispute or difference




iap By Act (‘Y’ of 1980

>t[60

o

.g.
g

Electxrwtty (Stipply) Amendment I Y 101 ‘ .

shall be referred to the arbltratlon of “the Authorlty’ durmgw o

- the period between the date of thé constitution of such com-

- ~mittee and the date of the order of the State Government ‘

made on the recommendations of the committee.”;
M in paragrapﬂ}vr XVII,—
(a) 'in sub-paragraph 1),—

(i) for clause (a), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:— : '

.o “(a) . the original cost of fixed assets available

.. . for use and necessary for the purpose of ‘the under-

Aaking subject to the provisions of paragraph XII in

w’  respect of service lines, and the excess amount
" referred to in the proviso to sub-paragraph (2) of
- paragraph VII in respect of any fixed asset which

- has ceased to be available for use;”; -

ISy

" (if) for clause (d), the following clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(d) the amount of investments compulsorily
> ' made under paragraph IV of this Schedule together
with the amount of such investments made after the
commencement of this Act from contributions. to-
wards depreciation as in the opinion of:the Autho-

" rity could not be utilised for the purpose of the
4. business of electricity supply of the undertaking;”;

(ii1) in clause (e) (). (which provides for deduc-
tion of certain amounts), the word ‘and’ at the end
shall be omitted; ' '

(iv) in clause (e) (i) (which provides for deduc-
tion of certain amounts), the words, figures and brackets

‘under the provisions of sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph _ ‘

I of the First Schedule’ shall be omitted;

© (v) ‘after the said clause (e) (ii), the :followmg sub-
clauses shall be inserted, namely:— .

“(ii1) the amount of security deposits of eon-
* - sumers held in cash;

- (iv) the amount standlng to the credit of. the .

" Tariffs and Dividends Control Reserve;

(v) the amount sct apart for the Develonment
Reserve




¢

: &pbym\ J‘?‘@ﬂe@@ |

| oza' 1956]

&

,Ele_c,tricflty‘ (Supply) Amendment‘;' S : ‘1161, :

~ of the licensee for distribution to the ‘consumers .
under paragraph IL”;

(b) in clause (b)’ of sub-paragraph (2),—
' (1) for the words ‘expenditure mcurred on’, the

stituted;

() in sub-clause (iv), the words, brackets and
figures ‘under sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph I of the
First Schedule’ shall be omitted;

(ii1) in sub-clause (x), for the word ‘hereinafter’,
"~ the word ‘hereinbefore’ shall be substituted;

(iv) in sub-clause (xi), after the words‘other ex-
penses’, the words and brackets ‘(excluding interest-on
debentures and loans)’ shall be inserted;

(v) - after sub-clause: (am) ‘the following sub—clause
shall be inserted, namely —

“(xiit) bonus paid to the employees of thg
undertaking-—

" (a) where any dispute regarding sueh
bonus has been referred to any tribunal or
“other authority under any law for the time
 being in force relating to industrial or labour
disputes, in accordance with the decision of
such tribunal or authority; C '

, (b) in any other case, Wlth the approval of -
i ' ‘the State Government.”;

(¢) in clause (¢) of sub-paragraph _(2);—

(i) in sub-clause (i), for the words, ‘actually appro-
priated for the purpose in the books of the undertaking’,
the words ‘permitted by the State Government’ shall be
substituted;

(ii) in sub-clause (i'b), for the word ‘hel'einafter’,
_ the word ‘hereinbefore’ shall be substituted;

- (Hi) after sub-clause (v), the followmg sub-clause
<ha11 be inserted, namely:—

“(va) contributions to the Development,
Reserve referred to in paragraph VA;”; ‘
1512 M. of Law——146

(1) "the amount carried-forward-in-the-aecounts.~ - .

words ‘expenditure properly incurred on’ shall be subn'




: 116" A Electmczty (Supply) Amendmenb [Ac'r 101

(d) 1n sub-paragraph (6) for c]ause (b) the followmg

- clause shall be subs‘ututed namely: -

“(h) interest charges on capital 'oicpend‘xture'

. incurred, during the period between the date of the
grant of the licence and the date when the undertaking
commences supply, from borrowed money and properly
attributable to the asset, accrued upto the date of such
commencement of supply at a rate not exceeding the

average Reserve Bank rate ruling at that time plus .

. one per centum.”’;
(e) in su‘b-paragraph 9),—

(i) for clause (b), the followmg clause shall be
substituted, namely:—

“(b) the  income derived from investments
other than.those included in the capital base under
the provisions of clause (d) of sub-paragraph (1).”;
(it) in clause (c), the words, figures and brackets

‘under sub-paragraph (2) of paragraph I of the First
‘ Schedule shall be omitted;

- (1) after clause (c), the following clause shall be
1nserted namely:— :

N “(d) an amount equal to one-half of one per centum
on the accumulations -in the Development Reserve
created under paragraph VA of this Schedule.”; ’

(f) for sub-paragraph (10), the following sub-para-
graph shall be substituted, namely:—

“(10) ‘standard rate’ in respect of any year of
account means the Reserve Bank rate ruling at the
beginning of that year, plus two per centum.”.

Amendment 28, In the Seventh Schedule to the principal Act,—
of Seventh - : .

Schedule,

tuted, namely:—

“(See sections 57, 5TA and 68 and the Fourth and the
Sixth Sechedules.”;

(b) the heading, namely, ‘Depreciation of assets’ and para-
graphs I and II shall be omitted;

(¢) the heading of the Table, namely, the words, ﬁgurés and

brackets ‘(See also section 57 and the Fourth and Sixth Sche-.

dules)’ shall be omitted;

i

(a) for the words, figures and’ brackets ‘ (See section 68 and
‘the Fifth and Eighth Schedules)’ the followmg shall be substi-




WBep. by Ack SE i%@ ' o e
 orF 1956] Electnczty (Supply) Amendment 1163

'nv'the Table;-in-itern- V,‘ 2

AR Y
£ :

, (i) after sub-item (d), (iv), the following sub-item' o
¥ » shall be inserted, namely:—

- “(iva) Roads other than kutcha roads—one hundred.”;

- (i) after sub-item (f), the followmg sub-item shall be
inserted, namely:—

“() Lightning arrestors—
(i) station type—Twenty.
" (it) pole type—Fifteen.
(iii) synchronous condensers—Thirty-five.”;

(#1i) for sub-item (#), the following sub-item shall be
substituted, namely: —

“ (i) Overhead lines, including supports—

. (i) lines on fabricated steel supports Qperating at
nominal voltages higher than 66 kilovolts—Thirty-five.
(ii) lines on steel supports operating at nominal
voltages, higher than 13.2 kilovolts but not exceeding

66 kilovolts— Thirty.
(m) 11nes on steel or reinforced concrete supports——
Twenty-five.

(iv) lines on treated wood supports—Twenty.”;

(iv) in sub-item (n), after clause (i), the following
clauses shall be inserted, namely:—

“(iit) Internal wiring, mcludmg fittings and appa-

ratus— . Fifteen.

(iv) street-hght fittings— Fifteen.”,

(v) after sub-item (o), the following sub-item shall be
inserted, namely: —

i

“(p) Communication equ1pment— -

(z) Radxo and high frequency carrier system—_
- Fifteen.
(i) Telephone lines and telephones—-—Twenty "

29. In the Eighth Schedule to the principal Act,—

" . Amendment
(i) in paragraph I— : _ of Eighth
. Schedule.

(@) in clause (b) for the words and brackets ¢ (including -
super-tax payable by the licensee as a company but exclud-
ing other taxes on profits)’, the words and bracketsanludmg




lep.by Act 5’5/011960 U .
: 1164 : Electmczty (Supply) Amendment ) [ACTS 101 & 103

(b) in clause (e), for the words and brackets beginning

w1th ‘interest on money’ and ending with ‘the production of

electricity therein’, the following words and brackets shall
be substituted, namely _— '

. “mterest on the deprec1ated cost of the station
shown in the books of the undertaking and  properly
attributable to the station (whether defrayed out of
capital or revenue) and interest on  working capital

_properly attributable to the statlon and the production
of electricity therem

v (i) in paragraph II, in clause (ii) of sub-paragraph (b)
for the words and figure ‘6 per centum per annum’, the words
‘the Reserve Bank rate ruling at the beginning 'of' that year
plus two per centum’ shall be substituted. '

THF INDIAN MEDICAL COUNCIL ACT 1955
Not Corrected: See India Code

Vot ALp — st T
- SECTIQNS

ARRANGEMENT OF SECTIONS

1. Short title, extent ‘and commencemeht.

2. Definitions. |

3. Constitution and comp051t10n of the Counc11

4, Mode- of election. 7

5. Restrictions on nomination and membership.

6.\ Incorporation of the Council,

7. Term of oPﬁce of President, Vlce—Pre51dent and members.
8. Meetmgs of the Council.

9. Officers, Committees and serva_nts'of‘the Couhcil.

10. The Executlve Committee, |

11. Recogn1t1on of mecical qualifications granted by Umversmes
- or medical 1nst1tut10ns in India,

12, Recognition of medical qualifications granted-by medical insti- -

" tutions in countries with which there is a scheme of recipro-
\cxty

al]J taxes payable on income andvvproﬁts) shall be substitlited '




