


606 Workmen's Compensation (Amendment) [~cx 46 OF 20001 

thousand rupees" shall be substituted; 

( i i i )  in Explanation 11, occqmng after clause ( b )  and before clause (c),  for 
the words "two thousand rupees" occumng at boththe places, the words "four 
thousand rupees" shall respectively be substituted; 

( b )  in sub-section (4), for the words "one thousand rupees", the words "two 
thousand and five hundred rupees" shall be substituted. 

Amendment of 4. In section 4A of the principal Act, for sub-section (3A), the following sub-section 
Section 4A' shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(3A)  The interest and the penalty payable under sub-section (3) shall be paid 
to the workman or his dependant, as the case may be.". 


